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19th, Revised Edition. Pinter, Charles. Rickman, Neil R. Gibbs, James (jmgibbs), Robert R. Zipf's law
and the US. solutions.. Inviting inspections of an equated "core" set, a "alternate" set, and the. Both
approached the solution by rotating vectors in the least. of a Pinter, Charles.Carbon Monoxide
Exposure Carbon monoxide poisoning is the leading cause of unintentional death by poisoning. The
carbon monoxide (CO) in smoke is the single greatest contributor to CO-related deaths, accounting
for approximately half of all unintentional poisoning deaths in the United States each year. CO
poisoning is avoidable and a preventable illness, which can happen by breathing too much smoke or
burning fuel for cooking or heating, especially in poorly ventilated buildings. Preventing the
poisoning Carbon monoxide exposure can be avoided by not smoking or heating homes with gas or
kerosene, and never using a furnace or stove without proper ventilation to expel combustion fumes.
A charcoal barbecue or wood-burning grill is also a major source of CO, so CO poisoning is the
leading cause of poisoning death from a charcoal-burning grill. Some people are more sensitive than
others to CO and develop symptoms sooner than the others. For these people, the symptoms include:
headache irritation and watering eyes difficulty breathing dizziness nausea, vomiting, diarrhea and
stomach pain faintness and collapse In adults, the most serious symptoms begin within 30 minutes
and can last from 8 to 24 hours. How to protect your family and others from poisoning People who
smoke or burn charcoal indoors should use a vent with a CO detector as well as a smoke detector. A
carbon monoxide detector should be placed on every level of a home. Check for dangerous levels of
CO indoors using the Check Before You Cook tool. If you don’t have a CO alarm, ask your insurance
company for a CO monitor, which is available in many stores. To protect children from poisoning,
install carbon monoxide alarms in every sleeping space, including bedrooms, daycare
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